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Hughes, Krysten (CCRA - Housing and Regeneration - Housing Funding)

From: Krysten.Hughes4@gov.wales on behalf of
’ socialhousinggrantprogramme@gov.wales
Sent: ' 28 February 2020 08:59 . -
To: ' Jo Yellen
Cc: ' , Coggins, Sian (CCRA - Housing and Regeneration - Housing Funding) -
Subject: : RE: 2018/001 - Malvern Drive, Llanishen, Cardiff (Acquisition and Construction
Claim.) :
Hi Jo

Thanks for your Grant claims for Malvern drive. | can confirm that we've recently made payments
of:

£2,637,500 T1 and £476,500 T2 pp — these are SHG payments and should have reached your
bank account around the 25! February.

We've also processed the RCG payment of £1, 569 000 as T2 pp — this is money you already have
“as RCG so we don't actually make a payment for this.

Hope this helps. \

Kind regards

Krysten Hughes

TTm'CyIIid Tai/Housing Funding Team

Yr Is-adran Cartrefi a Lleoedd/Homes and Places Division

Gnwp Addysg a Gwasanaethau Cyhoeddus/Education and Public Services Group
Liywodraeth Cymru/Welsh Government

Rhydycar, Merthyr Tydfil, CF48 1UZ

Ffon/Tel:. 03000 256001
E-bost/Email: Krysten.Hughes4@gov.wales

From: Jo Yellen <jo.yellen@linc-cymru.co.uk>

Sent: 27 February 2020 15:13

To: SHG Scheme Dellvery/CyfIawm Cynllun GTC <SHGSchemeDelivery@gov. wales>

Cc: Coggins, Sian (EPS - Homes & Places) <Sian.Coggins@gov.wales>

Subject: RE: 2018/001 - Malvern Drive, Llanishen;, Cardiff (Acquisition and Construction Claim:)

Good afternoon,

With the deadline approaching for grant claims for planned schemes (2019/20), | would be grateful if you could
confirm whether you have all of the information that you require in relation to our application for SHG for Malvern
Drive - submitted on 14™ February.

Thanks

Jo Yellen
Project Manager




‘Linc Cymru Housing Association
387 Newport Road . Cardiff . CF24 1GG

T: 02920 474750/ 07501 720443
E: jo.yellen@linc-cymru.co.uk
W: www.linc-cymru.co.uk

From: Jo Yellen ' '

Sent: 14 February 2020 15:09

To: SHGSchemeDelivery@gov.wales

Subject: FW: 2018/001 - Malvern Drive, Llanishen, Cardiff (Acquisition and Construction Claim.)

Hi all,

Please see attached the following documents to support our grant claim for Malvern Drive:

e JCT Design and Build Articles of Agreement

¢ Copy of the Planning Decision Notice

e  0342-RI0-A-00-DR-A-01020-20 - Block A - GA Ground Floor Plan
e  0342-RI0-B-00-DR-A-01024-17 - Block B - GA Ground Floor Plan

Thanks '

Jo Yellen
Project Manager

Linc Cymru Housing Association
.387 Newport Road . Cardiff . CF24 1GG

T: 02920 474750/ 07501 720443
E: jo.yellen@linc-cymru.co.uk
W: www.linc-cymru.co.uk

From: Sian.Coggins@gov.wales <Sian.Coggins@gov.wales> On Behalf Of SHGSchemeDelivery@gov.wales
" Sent: 14 February 2020 14:44 '

To: Jo Yellen <jo.vellen@linc-cymru.co.uk>; SHGSchemeDelivery@gov.wales

Subject: RE: 2018/001 - Malvern Drive, Llanishen, Cardiff (Acquisition and Construction Claim.)

Hi Jo thank you for your grant claim. Unfortunately we are unable to access your link because of
Welsh Government security protocols. You will need to submit the documents via email I'm afraid.

Thank you

Sian ‘ ,

From: Jo Yellen <jo.vellen@linc-cymru.co.uk>
‘Sent: 14 February 2020 13:25 '




To: SHG Scheme Delivery / Cyflawni Cynllun GTC <SHGSchemeDelivery@gov.wales>
Subject: 2018/001 - Malvern Drive, Llanishen, Cardiff (Acquisition and Construction Claim.)

Good afternoon,

Please find attached our acquisition and construction grant claim for Malvern Drive, Cardiff.

linclude the following supporting documents:
1. Grant 3 Application for Social Housing Grant (attached)
2. Completed Grant Checkllst

Due to the file size, the remaining supporting documents listed below can be accessed via the following link:
https://we.tl/t-13rCOc4h5]

Solicitor’s Certificate of Title

Updated Valuation Report dated 12" February 2020

Architect Certificate No. 1

JCT Design and Build Articles of Agreement

Copy of the Planning Decision Notice
0342-RI0-A-00-DR-A-01020-20 — Block A — GA Ground Floor Plan
O342—RIO—B-OO—DR-A~01024-17 — Block B — GA Ground Floor Plan
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. There follows a summary of the background and current status:-

e Lincreceived WG Stage 1,2 and 3 approva! on 29" June 2018.

e The WG approval is based on a land value of £2,500,000. An updated valuation has since been
commissioned and the District Valuer has placed a market value of £2,600,000 on the land. This claim has
been prepared in line with the WG Scheme 2 approval for stages 1, 2 and 3 and Cardiff Council’s Programme
Delivery Plan. ' :

e Linc's planning application for the development was registered as valid on 21* December 2017 and the
project is therefore not formally subject to SAB requirements which were introduced on 7th January 2019.

e GA floor plans are included in the supported information to show the three passenger lifts :

If you have any queries, please don’t hesitate to contact me.

Kind Regards

Jo Yellen
Project Manager

Linc Cymru Housing Association
. 387 Newport Road . Cardiff . CF24 1GG

T: 02920 474750/ 07501 720443
E: jo.yellen@linc-cymru.co.uk
W: www.linc-cymru.co.uk

-- Disclaimer -- This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use
of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this e-mail in error please notify
‘the originator of the message. This footer also confirms that this e-mail message has been scanned for the
presence of computer viruses. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender,
except where the sender specifies and with authority, states them to be the views of Linc-Cymru Housing
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Association Limited. Virus Scanning of this message is performed by Microsoft Office 365 Security and
Compliance Service as part of MS Exchange Online . Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is an |
Industrial and Provident Society registered under charitable rules with the Financial Conduct Authority (No
IP25555R) Line-Cymru Housing Association Limited is registered in Wales with the National Assembly
(No L109) Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is registered with the Information Commissioner's
Office (Z6152868) Linc-Cymru Housing Association's registered address is: 387 Newport Road, Cardiff,
CF24 1GG.
Sganiwyd y neges hon am bob feirws hysbys wrth iddi adael Llywodraeth Cymru. Mae Llywodraeth Cymru yn cymryd
o ddifrif yr angen i ddiogelu eich data. Os cysylltwch & Llywodraeth Cymru, mae ein hysbysiad preifatrwydd yn
esbonio sut rydym yn defnyddio eich gwybodaeth a sut rydym yn diogelu eich preifatrwydd. Rydym yn croesawu
gohebiaeth yn Gymraeg. Byddwn yn anfon ateb yn Gymraeg i ohebiaeth a dderbynnir yh Gymraeg ac ni fydd gohebu
yn Gymraeg yn arwain at oedi. On leaving the Welsh Government this email was scanned for all known viruses. The
Welsh Government takes the protection of your data seriously. If you contact the Welsh Government then our
Privacy Notice explains how we use your information and the ways in which we protect your privacy. We welcome
receiving correspondence in Welsh. Any correspondence received in Welsh will be answered in Welsh and
_corresponding in Welsh will not lead to a delay in responding. :
-- Disclaimer -- This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use
of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this e-mail in error please notify
the originator of the message. This footer also confirms that this e-mail message has been scanned for the
presence of computer viruses. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender,
except where the sender specifies and with authority, states them to be the views of Linc-Cymru Housing
Association Limited. Virus Scanning of this message is performed by Microsoft Office 365 Security and
Compliance Service as part of MS Exchange Online . Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is an
Industrial and Provident Society registered under charitable rules with the Financial Conduct Authority (No
IP25555R) Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is registered in Wales with the National Assembly
(No L109) Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is registered with the Information Commissioner's
Office (26152868) Linc-Cymru Housing Association's registered address is: 387 Newport Road, Cardiff,
CF24 1GG.
Sganiwyd y neges hon am bob feirws hysbys wrth iddi adael Llywodraeth Cymru. Mae Llywodraeth
Cymru yn cymryd o ddifrif yr angen i ddiogelu eich data. Os cysylltwch & Llywodraeth Cymru, mae ein
hysbysiad preifatrwydd yn esbonio sut rydym yn defnyddio eich gwybodaeth a sut rydym yn diogelu
eich preifatrwydd. Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn Gymraeg. Byddwn yn anfon ateb yn Gymraeg i
ohebiaeth a dderbynnir yn Gymraeg ac ni fydd gohebu yn Gymraeg yn arwain at oedi. On leaving the
Welsh Government this email was scanned for all known viruses. The Welsh Government takes the
protection of your data seriously. If you contact the Welsh Government then our Privacy Notice
explains how we use your information and the ways in which we protect your privacy. We welcome
receiving correspondence in Welsh. Any correspondence received in Welsh will be answered in
Welsh and corresponding in Welsh will not lead to a delay in responding.
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" From: Chris Monk <chris.monk@linc- ~cymru.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, Septembeér 3, 2021 2:38 PM
~To: Social Housing Grant Programme <soc1aIhou5|nggrantprogramme@gov wales> ,
' Subject FW: Data Collection - Materlals Cost'Increases - return by Friday.3rd September 2021 please

Hiall,
Please find attached the spreadsheet: completed.

We have another scheme which has not yet received approval (a submission is due soon) where the contractor has
submitted. information for consideration. I've populated a separate spreadsheet for this (given it doesn’t meet the
_ -criteria of the data gatherlng exerase) Also attached isa copy of quotes for the timber frame for-the prOJect Six
~ months apart. : : Lo » :

» lt has also been hlghllghted that in addltlon to the matenal cost increases, the avallablhty ofmaterlals is ah issue .

" too. With the shortage of materials-and delayed deliveries, projects are taking longer to complete and are having a

monetary effect (prel‘l‘mmarles, liquidated and ascertained damages)
" Piease let me kno}w‘ if you ha\re an‘y oues'tions.
_I\/lahythanks, » |

Chris Monk - v ‘ ,
Commercial SurVeyOr o o S o ,

Linc

me Cymru Housmg Assocratlon 387 Newport Road Cardlff CF24 1GG ;
Cymdelthas Tai Linc Cymru 387 Heol Casnewydd Caerdydd CF24 1GG

Q7772 524058
" linc-cymru.co.uk

n . | |




From: Helga.Warren@gov.wales <Helga.Warren@gov.wales>

Sent: Wednesday, August 18, 2021 4:14 pm '

To: Helga.Warren@gov.wales

Subject: Data Collection - Materials Cost Increases - return by Friday 3rd September 2021 please.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. '

This e-mail is being sent to all Chief Executives of RSLs and Development Directors and
CHC

Al

Further to the meeting held today between Community Housing Cymru, Chief Executives &
Development Directors of RSLs and Welsh Government, | enclose for your attention a
spreadsheet for completion and return to the SHG mailbox —
socialhousinggrantprogramme@gov.wales by Friday 3™ September 2021.

The intention of the spreadsheet is to gain a full understanding of the materials cost increases that
are being reported by contractors. The spreadsheet applies to all schemes that have received a
construction stage approval and are either on site or about to go on site, or sign the contract. The
information requested is straightforward and guidance is provided within the spreadsheet.

Please return the spreadsheet by the due date so that we can confirm the way forward as quickly
as possible. If you have any queries, please contact the mailbox in the first instance.

Regards and many thanks for your cooperation.

Helga

Helga Warren

Yr Is-adran Cartrefi a Lleoedd / Homes & Places Division
Llywodraeth Cymru / Welsh Government

Ffon / Tel: 07588 259864

E-bost / Email; helga.warren@gov.wales/helga.warren@gov.wales

Sganiwyd y neges hon am bob feirws hysbys wrth iddi adael Llywodraeth Cymru. Mae Llywodraeth Cymru yn cymryd
o ddifrif yr angen i ddiogelu eich data. Os cysylitwch & Llywodraeth Cymru, mae ein hysbysiad preifatrwydd yn
esbonio sut rydym yn defnyddio eich gwybodaeth a sut rydym yn diogelu eich prelfatrwydd Rydym yn croesawu
gohebiaeth yn Gymraeg. Byddwn yn anfon ateb yn Gymraeg i ohebiaeth a dderbynnir yn Gymraeg ac ni fydd gohebu
yn Gymraeg yn arwain at oedi. On leaving the Welsh Government this email was scanned for all known viruses. The
Welsh Government takes the protection of your data seriously. If you contact the Welsh Government ther our
Privacy Notice explains how we use your information and the ways in which we protect your privacy. We welcome
receiving correspondence in Welsh. Any correspondence received in Welsh will be answered in Welsh and
corresponding in Welsh will not lead to a delay in responding. -

-- Disclaimer -- This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for
the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this e-mailin error
please notify the originator of the message. This footer also confirms that this e-mail message has

2




been scanned for the presence of computer viruses. Any views expressed in this message are those
of the individual sender, except where thé sender specifies and with authority, states them to be the
views of Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited. Virus Scanning of this message is performed by
Microsoft Office 365 Security and Compliance Service as part of MS Exchange Online . Linc-Cymru
Housing Association Limited is an Industrial and Provident Society registered under charitable rules
with the Financial Conduct Authority (No IP25555R) Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is
registered in Wales with the National Assembly (No L109) Linc-Cymru Housing Association Limited is
registered with the Information Commissioner's Office (Z6152868) Linc-Cymru Housing Association's
registered address is: 387 Newport Road, Cardiff, CF24 1GG. »




