
 
 
 10 February 2022 
 
Dear  
 
ATISN 17051 – BAFTA Cymru 
 
Information requested 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 16 January 2023.  You asked for: 
 

1. How much money have Welsh Government bodies, such as Creative Wales, 
given to BAFTA Cymru since 2015? Please provide a breakdown of how 
much money and for what project via an excel document spreadsheet, thank 
you.  

2. How many Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic women were nominated for 
prizes in BAFTA awards 2022?  

3. How many Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic women won prizes in BAFTA 
awards 2022?  

4. How many non-Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic people were nominated for 
prizes in BAFTA awards 2022?  

5. How does the Welsh Government ensure that BAFTA Cymru adheres to the 
Public Sector Equality Duty relating to ethnicity and faith under the Equality 
Act 2010? 

6. How does the Welsh Government ensure that BAFTA Cymru adheres to the 
Public Sector Equality Duty relating to the Welsh Language Act 1993? 

7. Please provide the Welsh government's strategic equality impact assessment 
for work in the creative industries that monitors equality, diversity, and 
inclusion at BAFTA Cymru 

8. What % of the BAFTA Academy in Wales have been BAME since 2015? 
9. What % of the academy are Muslim since 2015? 
10. How does the government ensure that organisations which Welsh 

government funding ensure that they are aware of the PSED when it comes to 
anti-racism? 

11. Please provide BAFTA Cymru's response to the anti-racism Wales action 
plan.  

12. How many BAME people has Bafta Cymru hired since 2015? 
13. What proportion of the 2022 committee were BAME? Please give a 

breakdown by race, for example "90% of the 2021 committee was Black 
British". 

14. How many Welsh language speakers have been BAFTA winners? 
15. How many BAME people have been BAFTA winners? 

 
 
Our response 
 
 
1. How much money have Welsh Government bodies, such as Creative Wales, 
given to BAFTA Cymru since 2015? Please provide a breakdown of how much 



money and for what project via an excel document spreadsheet 
 
£67,160. Details attached as requested. 
 
2. How many Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic women were nominated for prizes in 
BAFTA awards 2022?  
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru nominations 
are published on their website. We are not notified of how many nominees identify as 
Black, Asian, Minority Ethnic or women. 
 
3. How many Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic women won prizes in BAFTA awards 
2022?  
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru winners are 
published on their website. We are not notified of how many winners identify as 
Black, Asian, Minority Ethnic or women. 
 
4. How many non-Black, Asian, and Minority Ethnic people were nominated for 
prizes in BAFTA awards 2022?  
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru nominations 
are published on their website. We are not notified of how many nominees identify as 
non-Black, Asian, or Minority Ethnic. 
 
5. How does the Welsh Government ensure that BAFTA Cymru adheres to the 
Public Sector Equality Duty relating to ethnicity and faith under the Equality Act 
2010? 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information, as BAFTA Cymru is not a 
public body and therefore is not covered by the Public Sector Equality Duty. 
 
6. How does the Welsh Government ensure that BAFTA Cymru adheres to the 
relating to the Welsh Language Act 1993? 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru is not covered 
by the requirements of the Welsh Language Act 1993. 
 
7. Please provide the Welsh government's strategic equality impact assessment for 
work in the creative industries that monitors equality, diversity, and inclusion at 
BAFTA Cymru 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. The Welsh Government, as a 
public body, is required to publish a strategic equality plan as part of its Public Sector 
Equality Duty. The Welsh Government’s strategic equality plan for the period 2020 to 
2024 is available here:  
Equality plan and objectives: 2020 to 2024 | GOV.WALES 
 
8. What % of the BAFTA Academy in Wales have been BAME since 2015? 
 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fequality-plan-and-objectives-2020-2024&data=05%7C01%7CStephen.Kingston%40gov.wales%7Cac5d7d97202848f795a308db0b38ccf1%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C638116110793826046%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=QIMMxidlgjsqcc%2BEmyRQyDoIEn0NYddIPSFh%2BMluLgw%3D&reserved=0


The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
9. What % of the academy are Muslim since 2015? 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
10. How does the government ensure that organisations which Welsh government 
funding ensure that they are aware of the PSED when it comes to anti-racism? 
 
The EHRC is the regulator of the PSED. The Welsh Government is subject to the 
PSED and must reflect this in its actions. Standard grant terms issued include 
requirements around the PSED. 
 
11. Please provide BAFTA Cymru's response to the anti-racism Wales action plan.  
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. The Welsh Government has 
no record of BAFTA responding to the ArWAP consultation. 
 
12. How many BAME people has Bafta Cymru hired since 2015? 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
13. What proportion of the 2022 committee were BAME? Please give a breakdown 
by race, for example "90% of the 2021 committee was Black British". 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
14. How many Welsh language speakers have been BAFTA winners? 
 
Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru winners are 
published on their website. We are not notified of how many winners are Welsh 
language speakers. 
 
15. How many BAME people have been BAFTA winners? 
 
Welsh Government does not hold this information. BAFTA Cymru winners are 
published on their website. We are not notified of how many winners identify as 
'BAME'. 
  
Next steps 
  
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you 
can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s 
Freedom of Information Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government, 
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  



CF10 3NQ  
 
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The 
Information Commissioner can be contacted at:  Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF. 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a 
complaint until it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

