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CF10 3NQ   

 

 
ATISN 14797 
 
 

10 February 2021 
  

 
Dear  
 
ATISN 14797: Vaccine Numbers     
 
Thank you for your request to the Welsh Government for information under the Freedom of 
Information Act (2000) received on 21 January. You requested information relating to the 
COVID-19 vaccinations, specifically:   
 

1. The number of doses of the Pfizer BionTech vaccine received in Wales by 20 
January 2021;  

2. The number of doses of the Oxford Astra Zeneca vaccine received in Wales by 20 
January 2021;  

3. The number of doses of the Pfizer BionTech vaccine that has been given by close of 
play 20 January 2021; 

4. The number of doses of the Oxford Astra Zeneca vaccine that has been given by 
close of play 20 January 2021; 

5. How many GP practices there are in Wales;  
6. How many community pharmacies there are in Wales and how many are offering the 

vaccine; 
7. How many volunteer vaccinators are there in Wales? 

 

Our Response 

To question 1 & 2: We are withholding information relating to the number of vaccine doses 
Wales has received under Section 28(1) sets out an exemption from the right to know, if the 
disclosure of the information in question would, or would be likely to prejudice relations 
between two or more United Kingdom administrations.  Please see Annex 1 for further 
information. 
 
To question 3 & 4: Welsh Government does not hold this level of data. However, daily 
updates about the number of vaccines administered in Wales is published by Public Health 
Wales:  https://public.tableau.com/profile/public.health.wales.health.protection#!/vizhome/Ra
pidCOVID-19virology-Public/Headlinesummary 
 
To question 5: There are 403 GP practices in Wales.  Further information regarding GP 
Practices is published on the attached link: https://gov.wales/general-practice-workforce-30-
june-2020 
 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fpublic.tableau.com%2Fprofile%2Fpublic.health.wales.health.protection%23!%2Fvizhome%2FRapidCOVID-19virology-Public%2FHeadlinesummary&data=04%7C01%7CJeanette.Warren%40gov.wales%7Cf883848ba20d4c6c1ed608d8b878a38b%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637462175557266516%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=DcaTUH5uETDgrnIek3RN%2BoWwcNTy295T4oeAM4kE4us%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fpublic.tableau.com%2Fprofile%2Fpublic.health.wales.health.protection%23!%2Fvizhome%2FRapidCOVID-19virology-Public%2FHeadlinesummary&data=04%7C01%7CJeanette.Warren%40gov.wales%7Cf883848ba20d4c6c1ed608d8b878a38b%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637462175557266516%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=DcaTUH5uETDgrnIek3RN%2BoWwcNTy295T4oeAM4kE4us%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fgeneral-practice-workforce-30-june-2020&data=04%7C01%7CJeanette.Warren%40gov.wales%7Cf833384519b14012886a08d8c2bfe069%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637473476638208799%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=5uSGPS8aGndtlMAn%2BHNH8T7W%2FMOB1XsTFuC08YZLl50%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fgeneral-practice-workforce-30-june-2020&data=04%7C01%7CJeanette.Warren%40gov.wales%7Cf833384519b14012886a08d8c2bfe069%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637473476638208799%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=5uSGPS8aGndtlMAn%2BHNH8T7W%2FMOB1XsTFuC08YZLl50%3D&reserved=0


 

 

To question 6: There are 714 pharmacies in Wales.  The first community pharmacy 
vaccine pilot in Wales started in a pharmacy in North West Wales on Friday 14 January 
using the Oxford-AstraZeneca vaccine. More pharmacists – and other primary care 
contractors, such as dentists and opticians – are being invited to help the huge effort to 
vaccinate people against coronavirus in the weeks and months ahead as supplies of the 
Oxford-AstraZeneca vaccine increase.  
 
To question 7: Welsh Government does not hold this information.  You may wish to contact 
individual health boards for the information you are seeking.  For your convenience, I have 
attached their contact details in Annex 2 of this letter. 
 
Additional Information: 
Information will be made available on the vaccination part of the Welsh Government  

website:  https://gov.wales/vaccine-coronavirus 

 

Next Steps 

The request you sent me contains personal information about you - for example, your name 
and address. The Welsh Government will be the data processor for this information and, in 
accordance with the General Data Protection Regulation, it will be processed in order to 
fulfil our public task and meet our legal obligations under the Act to provide you with a 
response. 

We will only use this personal information to deal with your request and any matters which 
arise as a result of it. We will keep your personal information and all other information 
relating to your request for three years from the date on which your request is finally closed.  
Your personal information will then be disposed of securely. 

Under data protection legislation, you have the right:  

• to be informed of the personal data we hold about you and to access it 
• to require us to rectify inaccuracies in that data 
• to (in certain circumstances) object to or restrict processing 
• for (in certain circumstances) your data to be ‘erased’ 
• to (in certain circumstances) data portability 
• to lodge a complaint with the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) who is our 

independent regulator for data protection 

For further information about the information which the Welsh Government holds and its 
use, or if you wish to exercise your rights under the GDPR, please see contact details 
below: 

Data Protection Officer 
Welsh Government 
Cathays Park  
CARDIFF 
CF10 3NQ 
Email: DataProtectionOfficer@gov.wales  

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can ask 
for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  Requests for an 
internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s Freedom of Information 
Officer at:  

Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government,  

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fvaccine-coronavirus&data=04%7C01%7CJeanette.Warren%40gov.wales%7C08a877a148db49734c8c08d8c1e23b39%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637472524676423214%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=ZEe6ui0iucRVa096llFBT0puytoIr%2BhEtIKjfS735KU%3D&reserved=0
mailto:DataProtectionOfficer@gov.wales


 

 

Cathays Park,  
CARDIFF,  
CF10 3NQ  
Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales  

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   

Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
CHESHIRE,  
SK9 5AF. 

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it 
has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely, 

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales


 

 

Annex 1 

Engagement of Section 28(1)  

Section 28(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) sets out an exemption from 
the right to know, if the disclosure of the information in question would, or would be likely to 
prejudice relations between two or more United Kingdom administrations.  

Officials have carefully considered all of the information captured by this request and 
consider that the information in question should be exempt under Section 28 (1) of the 
freedom of information act. 

Section 28 is a qualified exemption. This means that it can only be relied upon where the 
public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interests in disclosing the 
information.  

Public interest arguments in favour of release  

The Covid-19 pandemic is the greatest public health threat to the World in a hundred years 
and has resulted in major changes to everybody’s lifestyle as governments around the world 
try to control the outbreak and keep their citizens safe and healthy. We recognise that there 
is a very strong public interest in the public understanding the decisions and actions taken 
by the Welsh Government to protect the people of Wales. Going forward, vaccination is 
seen as a key tool in the management of the virus. Consequentially there is a very strong 
public interest in the development of our policies and understanding how many doses of the 
vaccines is being received by Welsh Government, particularly as this can differ from other 
administrations. 

The Welsh Government therefore, has endeavoured to ensure we are as transparent as 
possible, in particular through the media, publication of documents, Ministerial Written 
Statements and public statements in the Senedd along with ministerial press conferences 
and interviews. We recognise that transparency and openness improves public trust, 
leading to greater compliance with the measures introduced to bring the outbreak under 
control and thus reducing the overall impact of the virus on the people of Wales.   

Public interest arguments in favour of withholding  

There is a public interest in ensuring a close and effective working relationship between the 
Welsh Government and the UK Government.  Good relations and engagement are essential 
at this time as we seek to work with, and influence the UK Government and its agencies to 
ensure that the interests of Wales are protected in their discussions.  

We believe that this exemption is engaged as, if the information that is captured by this 
request were to be released, it would, or would be likely, to prejudice relations between the 
United Kingdom Government and all of the devolved administrations; the Welsh 
Government, the Scottish Government and the Northern Ireland Executive. 

The information being withheld involves subject matter which may still be privy to current 
and or future considerations by the four administrations. The UK Government has recently 
asked the other UK nations to refrain from publicly disclosing information on COVID-19 
vaccine supply levels, procured by UK Government on behalf of the four nations, due to 
commercially sensitive and security reasons. This relates to supply data which is both future 
and retrospective. This is also still the subject of high level discussions.  

Therefore we believe that disclosing this information may damage our relationship with them 
by prejudicing confidence and compromise the mutual trust. This could inhibit future 
collaborative working between both parties and detrimental at a time where good relations – 
and communication - between the Welsh Government, other devolved nations and the UK 



 

 

Government are essential, in the midst of the global COVID-19 pandemic and vaccination 
roll-out.  

Conclusion  

Whilst recognising that there are public interest arguments for disclosure of the requested 
information related to this request, I consider that the public interest in withholding the 
information outweighs that in releasing it in this instance.  

 

  



 

 

Annex 2 

NHS Health Boards – Freedom of Information Contacts 
 
Aneurin Bevan 
Aneurin Bevan University Health Board 
Headquarters, St Cadoc's Hospital 
Lodge Road 
Caerleon 
Newport, NP18 3XQ 
Email: FOI.ABB@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Betsi Cadwaladr  
Information Governance Department 
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 
Ysbyty Glan Clwyd 
Sarn Lane 
Bodelwyddan 
Rhyl, LL18 5UJ 
Email: bcu.foi@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Cardiff and Vale 
Cardiff and Vale UHB Headquarters 
University Hospital of Wales (UHW) 
Heath Park 
Cardiff, CF14 4XW 
Email: CAV_FOI.Requests@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Cwm Taf Morgannwg 
Freedom of Information Officer 
Cwm Taf Health Board 
Ynysmeurig House 
Navigation Park 
Abercynon, CF45 4SN 
E-mail: freedomofinformation@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Hywel Dda 
The Freedom of Information Officer 
Hywel Dda University Health Board 
Corporate Offices, Ystwyth Building 
St David's Park 
Job's Well Road 
Carmarthen, SA31 3BB        
Email: FOI.HywelDda@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Powys Teaching Health Board 
Information Governance Team 
Quality & Safety Unit 
Training Department, Bronllys Hospital 
Bronllys 
Brecon 
Powys, LD3 0LS 
Email: foi.foi@wales.nhs.uk  

mailto:FOI.ABB@wales.nhs.uk?subject=Freedom%20of%20Information%20Request
mailto:bcu.foi@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:freedomofinformation@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI.HywelDda@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:foi.foi@wales.nhs.uk


 

 

 
Swansea Bay University Health Board 
FOIA Team 
Swansea Bay University Health Board 
1 Talbot Gateway 
Baglan Energy Park 
Port Talbot, SA12 7BR    
Email: FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Velindre NHS Trust 
Communications Team 
Velindre NHS Trust Headquarters. 
Unit 2 Charnwood Court, 
Parc Nantgarw, 
Nantgarw, 
Cardiff, CF15 7QZ 
Email: Corporate.Services2@wales.nhs.uk   
 
WAST 
Welsh Ambulance Service (NHS) Trust 
H.M. Stanley Hospital 
St Asaph 
Denbighshire, LL17 0RS 
Email: FOI.amb@wales.nhs.uk 
 
Public Health Wales 
Freedom of Information Office 
Public Health Wales 
Floor 3, 2 Capital Quarter 
Tyndall Street 
Cardiff, CF10 4BZ 
Email: foi.phw@wales.nhs.uk  
 

mailto:FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:Corporate.Services2@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI.amb@wales.nhs.uk
mailto:foi.phw@wales.nhs.uk

