
 
 
17 December 2020 
 
Dear                         , 
 
ATISN 14602 - Child Trust Funds 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 30 November about Child Trust 
Funds and the email of clarification submitted on 3 December.  The information you 
requested is enclosed. 
 
1. You asked, how many CTF accounts were opened in Wales under the previous 
UK Government scheme between 2002 and 2011, and what is the total value of 
these accounts?  
 
Welsh Government does not hold published information on the number of accounts 
opened by the UK Government in Wales. However, according to HMRC data1, 
273,000 CTF accounts were opened in Wales, benefitting an average of 33,000 
children a year during the period in which CTFs were available. The total value of 
CTFs in Wales was assessed to be around £200m in 2012, equating to an average 
value per account of £733. Although we do not have published data on the current 
value of CTFs in Wales it can be estimated that the current value is likely to be 
around £275m.  
 
2. You asked, how many CTF accounts have remained unopened in Wales, and what 
is the total value of these accounts? 
 
In answer to your question, the process adopted by the UK Government scheme 
meant that there were no unopened CFT accounts in Wales. The UK Government 
issued vouchers to parents and guardians’ of eligible children and if the voucher was 
not used to open a Child Trust Fund before the expiry date the UK Government 
intervened to set up a Revenue allocated account (RAA) on behalf of the child. 
Published figures reveal that 1.8 million RAAs were set up by HMRC during the 
lifetime of the scheme. Welsh Government does not hold published data on the 
percentage of RAAs opened in Wales but HMRC may be able to provide you with 
more information on these figures.  
 
3. You asked, how much did the Welsh Government allocate for the Child Trust Fund 
Cymru scheme that ran between 2009 and 2011? 
 
 
The CTF Cymru scheme was launched in November 2009. The scheme continued 
throughout the financial year 2010 – 2011 with an allocated budget of £2.5million.  
 

                                            
1 [1] Child Trust Funds Statistics, Detailed Distributional Analysis, HMRC, Feb 2013. 

https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk/government/uploads/system/uploads/attachment_data/file
/360495/Report_143.pdf 
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4. You asked, how much has the Welsh Government spent on advertising on 
promoting the existence of CTF accounts, and how to access these?  
 
In financial year 2009/2010 the Welsh Government spent £31,725.16 on promoting 
the CTF Cymru scheme and a further £5,898.50 in financial year 2010/ 2011. There 
was no specific funding allocation for promoting the CTF scheme before or after 
these dates. 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you 
can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s 
Freedom of Information Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government, 
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  
CF10 3NQ  
 
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The 
Information Commissioner can be contacted at:  Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF. 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a 
complaint until it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely 
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