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Dear  
 
ATISN 14321 – Deaths from Covid, Testing, Vaccine, Masks and Gatherings 
 
Thank you for your request to the Welsh Government for information under the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 received on 16 September. You asked for: 
 
Deaths from the Covid virus 
 
a) The exact number of deaths from Covid (England and Wales), these are deaths of 

people with no other pathologies prior to contracting the virus, who succumbed to it. 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. Public Health Wales (PHW) 
publishes statistics regarding Covid-19 on their website, which can be found below: 
 
https://phw.nhs.wales/topics/latest-information-on-novel-coronavirus-covid-19/ 

 
b) Were any autopsies carried out of these people to gather scientific information, and if so 
did any had other ailments were discovered, which was not detected at priori? Can you 
provide the results of any autopsies (not names) 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
c) Can you explain why the NHS applies a 28 days rules on the death of a discharged 
patient. 
 
The Welsh Government does not hold this information. 
 
Testing 
 
a) What exactly are you testing/searching for with a swab, does the test distinguish between 
influenza and the common cold, and to what degree of accuracy, the antibodies testing 
(blood) which antibodies and over what time period? 
 
b) Can you please confirm the amplification cycle, for how long and the temperature used 

https://phw.nhs.wales/topics/latest-information-on-novel-coronavirus-covid-19/


 

 

when the tests are analysed 
 
c) What happens to all the test swabs collected, and for how long are they kept. 
 
I can confirm that the Welsh Government does not hold the information you requested 
regarding Testing. 
 
Tests are carried out in either PHW laboratories or by Lighthouse laboratories.  Information 
about lab processes including amplification cycles will be held by PHW or the Department 
for Health and Social Care. 
 
Should you wish to submit a Freedom of Information request to these organisations, you 
can do so through the following channels: 
 
Public Health Wales 
https://phw.nhs.wales/use-of-site/contact-us/freedom-of-information/ 
 
Department for Health and Social Care 
https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-information-request 
 
 
3. Vaccine 
 
Under the Nuremberg Code on experimenting on people, have the companies 
researching the vaccine, followed the code? Can your department categorically confirm 
it has ensured the code is followed, and the procedures for vaccine testing and approval 
have been adhered to, to ensure validity and compliance. 

Whilst the Nuremburg Code is not legally binding in law, it has laid the foundations for the 
governance and conduct of clinical trials. This includes the International Conference on 
Harmonisation of Good Clinical Practice (ICH GCP), an international ethical and scientific 
quality standard for designing, conducting, recording and reporting trials that involve the 
participation of human subjects and the Declaration of Helsinki (1964), which sets out the 
ethical principles for medical research involving human subjects.   

Clinical trials undertaken in the UK are underpinned by the UK Medicines for Human Use 
(Clinical Trials) Regulations 2004 which are intended to protect the rights, safety and well-
being of research participants. The Regulations transpose the provisions of the European 
Clinical Trials Directive (EC2001/20) into UK law and apply to trials designed to generate 
information on the efficacy or safety of medicines. In the UK, clinical trials of medicines and 
studies on medical devices are authorised by the Medicines and Healthcare Products and 
Regulatory Agency (MHRA). Before a clinical trial can begin, the MHRA needs to review 
and authorise the trial. The MHRA also inspects sites where trials take place to ensure that 
they are conducted in line with good clinical practice.  

In the UK, the Health Research Authority (HRA) is responsible for making sure research in 
the UK is ethically reviewed and approved. In addition to authorisation from the MHRA, 
before a research study can commence, Research Ethics Committees (RECs) 
review research applications and give an opinion about whether the research is ethical. 
They look at areas such as the proposed participant involvement and are entirely 
independent of research sponsors (that is, the organisations which are responsible for the 
management and conduct of the research), funders and investigators. This enables them to 

https://phw.nhs.wales/use-of-site/contact-us/freedom-of-information/
https://www.gov.uk/make-a-freedom-of-information-request


 

 

put participants at the centre of their review. Further information on RECs and the REC 
review process is available here: 
 
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/approvals-amendments/what-approvals-do-i-need/research-ethics-
committee-review/ 
 

The HRA also provides information on the process around safety reporting for clinical trials 
of investigational medicinal products (CTIMPS) throughout the trial. Further information is 
available via the HRA website: 
 
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/approvals-amendments/managing-your-approval/safety-reporting/ 
 

The UK Policy Framework for Health and Social Care Research sets out principles of good 
practice in the management and conduct of health and social care research. The framework 
is for organisations and individuals that have responsibilities for health and social care 
research.  This includes funders, sponsors, researchers and their employers, research sites 
and care providers. More information on this is available via this link:  
 
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/planning-and-improving-research/policies-standards-legislation/uk-
policy-framework-health-social-care-research/ 
 
a) What is the vaccine life cycle in your body. How often do you have retake it? 
 
A number of potential vaccines for COVID-19 are being studied to see if they’re effective 
and safe, we are monitoring the progress of their development.  The UK Government, 
through its COVID Vaccine Taskforce, is leading the work on funding and procuring 
vaccines for the UK. We do not know at this stage whether any successful vaccine will be a 
single vaccine or cyclical like Flu vaccine until we study how long immunity lasts after 
vaccination – this is part of the trials, and will form part of monitoring following vaccination. 
 
b) Have the vaccine companies been exempt for any liability from problems occurring after 
the virus? 
 
Human medicines and medicinal products, including their authorisations for use and the 
regulation of prices, are a matter reserved to the UK Government. Welsh Ministers are 
consulted on proposed changes. The consultation on amendments to Human Medicines 
Regulations 2012 has just concluded and the UK Government will shortly publish its 
response. The SI enables the following policy objectives:  
 

1. Clarify that a temporary authorisation of a vaccine under regulation 174 of the 
HMRs can be permitted with specified conditions attached to ensure product safety, 
quality and efficacy. 

2. Clarify the scope of immunity from civil liability which regulation 345 puts in place for 
certain products whose unlicensed use is recommended by the licensing authority, 
and to clarify the consequences on immunity, should there be a breach of the 
conditions imposed. 

 
 
c) Why a virus with a survivability of 99% requires a vaccine, please provide the scientific 
data for this requirement. 
 

https://www.hra.nhs.uk/approvals-amendments/what-approvals-do-i-need/research-ethics-committee-review/
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/approvals-amendments/what-approvals-do-i-need/research-ethics-committee-review/
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/approvals-amendments/managing-your-approval/safety-reporting/
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/planning-and-improving-research/policies-standards-legislation/uk-policy-framework-health-social-care-research/
https://www.hra.nhs.uk/planning-and-improving-research/policies-standards-legislation/uk-policy-framework-health-social-care-research/


 

 

Vaccines can reduce or even eradicate some diseases, if enough people are vaccinated. 
Since vaccines were introduced, diseases like smallpox and polio that used to kill or disable 
millions of people are gone from the UK. The number of people worldwide who have died 
with Covid-19 has passed one million, with many regions still reporting surging numbers of 
new infections. People continue to get infected, and once the virus starts to spread it can do 
so rapidly. Even if people haven’t experienced it first hand, doesn’t mean it isn’t a threat.  
 
Being vaccinated will protect individuals and help stop the spread of the virus. Vaccination 
primes the body for exposure at a later date by stimulating immune memory through 
antibodies and T cells which destroy virus infected cells. Thus even though infection still 
occurs the person reacts with an immune response helping prevent against serious illness. 
Vaccines teach your immune system how to protect you from diseases. It's much safer for 
your immune system to learn this through vaccination than by catching the disease. 
 
4. Masks expect to contain: environmental condition, air flow inhale and exhale and 
the type of material tested. 
 
a) Was consideration taken, for people who have dermatological conditions, and what were 
they, please provide supporting data. 
 
b) Have any studies been carried out, on people who have respiratory problems, the effects 
of using masks on them, especially reflux.  

 
There isn’t data specifically for people who have dermatological conditions or a paper or 
study specifically on reflux but this link explains where there are some circumstances where 
people may not be able to wear a face covering: https://gov.wales/face-coverings-guidance-
public#section-52202 
 
c) The use of masks, can you explain why during lock-down, masks were not necessary, 
but now are compulsory in shops and even in open spaces, request for the raw data to 
support this. 
 
These two links can explain this section:  
 
https://gov.wales/face-coverings-guidance-public#section-52217      
 
https://gov.wales/technical-advisory-group-updated-advice-face-coverings 
 
5. Gathering 
 
a) On the rule of 6, can you provide the scientific data to support this rule, data that can be 
cross referenced, not mathematical models. Why 6? 
 
The rule of six has no specific evidence, although the maths associated with limiting the 
number of people is clear. In Wales, the key was that only two households should meet. 
 
b) The R value is being quoted, where is the raw data for the R value, this his data before 
being put through the formulae, and how finite to the area is the R value focussed. 
We do not have any estimates of Rt the reproduction number (sometimes referred to as the 
R rate) by county in Wales. The most recent Rt estimate for the whole of Wales is 1.1-1.4 as 
of 15th October 2020. There are local authority estimates of the R number produced by 
Imperial College London, these can be found on the following link: 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fface-coverings-guidance-public%23section-52202&data=04%7C01%7CChristopher.Maton%40gov.wales%7C1470e517173943dd477208d8751032cf%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637388059710755296%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=tfwnvKDEwPmfW2MsVDYc0gESX3N64VlEC2KK6%2BxCvOk%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fface-coverings-guidance-public%23section-52202&data=04%7C01%7CChristopher.Maton%40gov.wales%7C1470e517173943dd477208d8751032cf%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637388059710755296%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=tfwnvKDEwPmfW2MsVDYc0gESX3N64VlEC2KK6%2BxCvOk%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Fface-coverings-guidance-public%23section-52217&data=04%7C01%7CChristopher.Maton%40gov.wales%7C1470e517173943dd477208d8751032cf%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637388059710755296%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=X8UPyLp%2FMQJD6vPclUuh%2BAAoMCi7lW%2FHf4%2BXt3aL6kg%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Ftechnical-advisory-group-updated-advice-face-coverings&data=04%7C01%7CChristopher.Maton%40gov.wales%7C1470e517173943dd477208d8751032cf%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637388059710765254%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=mIUQ0UbRXrchm%2Bbx%2BN7StUzVcTAIocUMCIC6zU%2BZbSU%3D&reserved=0


 

 

 
https://imperialcollegelondon.github.io/covid19local/  
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can ask 
for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  Requests for an 
internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s Freedom of Information 
Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government,  
Cathays Park,  
CARDIFF,  
CF10 3NQ  
Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
CHESHIRE,  
SK9 5AF. 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it 
has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Any information released under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 or Environmental 
Information Regulations 2004 will be listed in the Welsh Government’s Disclosure Log (at 
https://gov.wales/about/open-government/freedom-of-information/responses/?lang=en). 
 
Yours sincerely, 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fimperialcollegelondon.github.io%2Fcovid19local%2F&data=04%7C01%7CChristopher.Maton%40gov.wales%7C1470e517173943dd477208d8751032cf%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637388059710765254%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=PX2TSvUO878CTfHRbWRWNnZjuyu2z9LS0ZM4PnySsqI%3D&reserved=0
mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales
https://gov.wales/about/open-government/freedom-of-information/responses/?lang=en

