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Dear  
 
Request for Information – ATISN 14185 

 
I wrote to you on 31 July regarding your request for information.  In relation to funding 
of £50,000 awarded to Ribride Velocity under the Welsh Government’s Micro and 
Small Business Fund (MSBF), you asked for:   
 
1. The Expression of Interest form submitted to the Welsh Government for the MSBF. 
2. The checks undertaken to ensure eligibility and priority criteria were met before the 

full MSBF application was submitted. 
3. The full MSBF application including impact assessment and environmental 

assessment. 
4. Post completion monitoring against agreed outputs up to the MSBF completion 

date of 30 July 2019.  
5. Post completion monitoring against agreed outputs to be recorded and monitored 

as a condition of the offer for 5 years following completion of the project on 30 July 
2019. 

6. Information showing how the project meets the goals of the Well-being of Future 
Generations (Wales) Act 2015. 

 
I confirm the Welsh Government holds some information caught by your request.  For 
the information we hold in relation to questions 1, 2, 3 and 4, I have concluded it is 
exempt from disclosure under Section 40, personal data and Section 43, prejudice to 
commercial interests of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  The reasoning for 
withholding this information is in the attached Annex.   
 
We do not hold an impact assessment or environmental assessment of the project as 
referred to in your third question.  This is because it is not necessary to provide that 
specific information in support of an MSBF application.  It is the applicant’s 
responsibility to meet all legal requirements.     In terms of the outputs you refer to in 
your fourth question, whilst the specific detail is withheld as explained above, I can 
advise that the main outputs are related to jobs and assets and all of those outputs 
have been met.   

25 August 2020 



 
We do not hold any information caught by your fifth question.  This is because the 
case has not yet reached the point at which a Post Completion Monitoring review will 
be requested. 
 
For your final question, the project was considered likely to meet a number of 
wellbeing goals, particularly in enabling a more Prosperous Wales, Resilient Wales, 
and Cohesive Community, driven largely by the impact of this business in growing the 
adventure and activity market that has developed in North Wales.  In part, this project 
is also relevant to creating a Vibrant Culture and in meeting Welsh Language goals, 
with the latter to be reviewed in the PCM period.  The only recorded information we 
hold on this is: “The project fits with 5 Well-Being Goals including Prosperous Wales, 
Resilient Wales, Cohesive Community, Vibrant Culture and Welsh Language goals.  
RR is a stand out and exemplar adventure tourism product in North West Wales and 
the quality of the proposed additional rib will strongly support these goals”.   
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can 
ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s 
Freedom of Information Officer at: 
 
Information Rights Unit, Welsh Government, Cathays Park, Cardiff, CF10 3NQ  
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales.  Please remember to quote the ATISN 
reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF.  However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a 
complaint until it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales


ANNEX 
 
ATISN 14185 – APPLICATION OF EXEMPTIONS 
 
Section 40(2) – Personal Data 
 
Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA), together with the 
conditions in section 40(3)(a)(i) or 40(3)(b), provides an absolute exemption if 
disclosure of the personal data would breach any of the data protection principles.  
 
‘Personal data’ is defined in sections 3(2) and (3) of the Data Protection Act 1998 (‘the 
DPA 2018’) and means any information relating to an identified or identifiable living 
individual. An identifiable living individual is one who can be identified, directly or 
indirectly, in particular by reference to an identifier such as a name, an identification 
number, location data, an online identifier or to one or more factors specific to the 
physical, physiological, genetic, mental, economic, cultural or social identity of the 
individual. 
 
We have concluded that, in this instance, some of the information contained within the 
information caught by your request contains third party personal data.  Specifically, 
this relates to names of individuals of the business and Welsh Government officials, 
their e-mail addresses and direct telephone numbers.  Other information includes CVs 
of company directors.   
 
Under Section 40(2) of the FOIA, personal data is exempt from release if disclosure 
would breach one of the data protection principles set out in Article 5 of the GDPR.  
We consider the principle being most relevant in this instance as being the first. This 
states that personal data must be: 
 
“processed lawfully, fairly and in a transparent manner in relation to the data subject” 
 
The lawful basis that is most relevant in relation to a request for information under the 
FOIA is Article 6(1)(f). This states: 
 
“processing is necessary for the purposes of the legitimate interests pursued by the 
controller or by a third party except where such interests are overridden by the 
interests or fundamental rights and freedoms of the data subject which require 
protection of personal data, in particular where the data subject is a child”. 
 
In considering the application of Article 6(1)(f) in the context of a request for 
information under FOIA it is necessary to consider the following three-part test: 
 
1. The Legitimate interest test: Whether a legitimate interest is being pursued in the 

request for information;  
2. The Necessity test: Whether disclosure of the information/confirmation or denial that 

it is held is necessary to meet the legitimate interest in question; 
3. The Balancing test: Whether the above interests override the interests, fundamental 

rights and freedoms of the data subject. 
 
Our consideration of these tests is set out below: 
 



1. Legitimate Interest Test 
The Welsh Government recognises there is a legitimate interest in being able to 
identify the parties involved in making an application for funding.  We do not believe, 
however, there is any legitimate reason why the personal data would need to be 
released in order to understand the application.  The application is made on behalf of 
the business and not the individuals concerned.  The Welsh Government cannot 
identify any other legitimate interest in you or the public receiving the personal data 
captured by your request.   
 
2. Is disclosure necessary? 
The Welsh Government is of the view that it is not necessary to disclose the personal 
information caught by your request.   It is straight forward, even when withholding the 
personal data, to understand the funding application.  As such we do not believe it is 
necessary to disclose the personal data.  Nor do we believe it is necessary to disclose 
the personal data in order to allow members of the public to contribute to this, or future 
discussions on this or any other matter. There are generic mechanisms by which the 
public can contact the Welsh Government and business.  
 
3. The Balancing Test 
As it has been concluded it is not necessary to disclose the identity of the individuals, 
there is no requirement to balance the rights and interests of those individuals against 
the rights, under FOIA, of the requester.    
 
To conclude, as release of the information would not be legitimate under Article 6(1)(f), 
and as no other condition of Article 6 is deemed to apply, release of the information 
would not be lawful within the meaning of the first data protection principle. It has 
therefore been withheld under section 40 of the Freedom of Information Act. Section 
40 is an absolute exemption and not subject to the public interest test. 
 
 
Section 43 (2) – Commercial Interests   
 

The information caught by this exemption relates to the information we hold in relation 
to your first four questions.   Decisions relating to non-disclosure of this information 
have been taken with due consideration of the exemptions identified under Section 
43(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).   This exemption states that: 
 
(2) Information is exempt information if its disclosure under this Act would, or would 

be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of any person (including the public 
authority holding it). 

 
Section 43 is a qualified (public interest tested) exemption. This means that in order to 
engage it, I must show that the public interest in withholding the information is greater 
than the public interest in releasing it. I have therefore given consideration to the 
effects of disclosure of the information to the world at large as the information is made 
available to anybody and everybody, not just the requestor.  
 
 
Public Interest For Release 
I recognise the general public interest in openness and transparency and releasing the 
information would help the public gain a better understanding of the decisions made by 



Government in relation to the funding it awards to businesses.  It is also recognised 
there is a public interest in how public money is to be, or has been, used to ensure the 
Government gets the best value from the public purse. 
 
Public Interest Against Release 
In reaching its decisions to award funding to businesses such as the Micro and Small 
Business Fund, it is necessary for businesses to submit to the Welsh Government a 
significant amount of commercially sensitive information about its business.  I can 
confirm that this is the case in relation to the Expression of Interest form and the full 
MSBF application you have requested.  Similarly with the checks and monitoring 
undertaken by the Welsh Government in relation to the funding awarded.   
 
The information you have requested includes financial details, both current and 
forecasted, specifically statutory/management accounts, cashflow details and 
evidence of project funding.  It also includes other commercially sensitive details on 
matters such as employment, project specifics, clients, marketing, branding, innovation 
and future business activities.  The level of detail provided is not intended for public 
consumption.  The development of Velocity was a high risk project for the business as 
it relates to the development of a first of type prototype as well as a first of type tourism 
attraction.  The support provided by the Welsh Government was critical in the 
development and success of the project.   
 
To disclose the information you have requested would mean disclosing operational 
data upon which the business relies in order to undertake its business activities in a 
competitive market.  This information is very much current and live information and it is 
commercially sensitive to the business.  The business is still in a commercially 
sensitive phase of its tourism offer and the commercial development of other tourism 
offers as well as other commercial applications for the vessel.  These are partnership 
developments which themselves are under Non Disclosure Agreements.  As such, 
placing the information into the public domain would likely be prejudicial to the current 
and future commercial interests of the business.   
 
I believe the public interest is satisfied by the amount of information being disclosed in 
response to this request for information.  The Welsh Government has also proactively 
published information on its support for the project which is suitable for the public 
domain, such as https://gov.wales/fastest-passenger-rib-world-coming-north-wales-
during-year-sea, https://businesswales.gov.wales/tourism/finance#guides-tabs--4,  
 https://businesswales.gov.wales/tourism/sites/tourism/files/documents/RDP-MSBF_-
_Offers_made_1_April_2017_to_31_March_2018_EN_CY.pdf  and 
https://businesswales.gov.wales/tourism/sites/tourism/files/documents/Roadshow_Inve
stment_Brochure_North_E.pdf  
  
I am aware that as a general rule, the sensitivity of information is likely to reduce over 
time, so that the age of information, or timing of the request may be relevant in 
determining whether to apply the exemption, or where the public interest may lie. In 
this case, however, the information captured is very much current information. 
  
In conclusion, I believe that the balance of the public interest therefore falls in favour of 
withholding some of the information you have requested as outlined above.   
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