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E-mail request 
 
 
Our ref: ATISN 14154 
Date: 30 July 2020 
 
Dear  
 
ATISN 14154 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 15 July 2020. With regard to the First 
Minister’s recent publicity photographs, you asked questions as listed at Annex 1. 
 
It is important to note that the Freedom of Information Act 2000 gives individuals a right of 
access to recorded information held by a public authority at the time the request was 
received. It does not require an authority such as the Welsh Government to provide views 
or opinions where those views are not already recorded. This is confirmed by the 
Information Commissioner’s guidance ‘The Guide to Freedom of Information’, page 7:   

 
“The Act does not cover information that is in someone’s head. If a member of the public 
asks for information, you only have to provide information you already have in recorded 
form. You do not have to create new information or find the answer to a question from staff 
who may happen to know it.”   

 
With that in mind, we do not believe that questions 7 and 8 are valid requests for recorded 
information. However, regardless of this, I can confirm that the Welsh Government does 
not hold recorded information that would answer them. I have addressed each of your 
remaining questions below. 
 

1. Was Mr Drakeford attending his official place of work on the 8th May 2020, 
and if so what work was he engaged in?  

 
I can confirm that the First Minister was at his official place of work and was 
engaged in official First Minister activities. You can visit the website to see his 
responsibilities: https://gov.wales/rt-hon-mark-drakeford-ms#section-15109 
 
On 8th May 2020 the First Minister also held a press conference on the coronavirus 
pandemic, and commemorations for the 75th anniversary of VE Day. 

 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fgov.wales%2Frt-hon-mark-drakeford-ms%23section-15109&data=02%7C01%7CCentralDepartments-FOIDP%40gov.wales%7C36c5d5a2d3ff4da0732408d832d6d4f0%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637315245557986836&sdata=TBlNP9V2W29p4g6HhlGESmce0GHflESuiHpln%2BVEWQw%3D&reserved=0


2. What procurement process did the Welsh Government undertake to hire the 
photographer who took the photographs?  

 
The Welsh Government does not hold recorded information of this description. 
However, I can confirm that the professional photographer was employed under a 
sole written quotation contract. 
 

3. Where was the information for this photography job advertised?  
4. How many other photographers applied for the job? 

 
The Welsh Government does not hold recorded information of this description. 
However, I can confirm that the Welsh Government has a bank of professional 
photographers that it works with in circumstances where, for example, work requires 
a fast turnaround for media demands. 

 
5. What is the relationship between the photographer and the Welsh 

Government, specifically is the photographer related to any member of the 
team that procured the photography or related to either Mr Drakeford or his 
team?  

 
The Welsh Government does not hold recorded information of this description.  

 
6. What checks did the Welsh Government carry out on the photographer to 

ensure they were not breaking lockdown regulations i.e. travelling from Barry 
to Cardiff is 20 miles. There is a myriad of much more locally based 
photographers  

 
The Welsh Government does not hold recorded information of this description. 

 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can ask 
for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an 
internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s Freedom of Information 
Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit  
Welsh Government 
Cathays Park  
Cardiff  
CF10 3NQ  
 
Or e-mail: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:   
 
Information Commissioner’s Office  
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane  
Wilmslow  
Cheshire  

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales


SK9 5AF 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until 
it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
  



Annex 1 
 

1. Was Mr Drakeford attending his official place of work on the 8th May 2020, and if so 
what work was he engaged in? 

2. What procurement process did the Welsh Government undertake to hire the 
photographer who took the photographs? 

3. Where was the information for this photography job advertised? 
4. How many other photographers applied for the job? 
5. What is the relationship between the photographer and the Welsh Government, 

specifically is the photographer related to any member of the team that procured the 
photography or related to either Mr Drakeford or his team? 

6. What checks did the Welsh Government carry out on the photographer to ensure 
they were not breaking lockdown regulations i.e. travelling from Barry to Cardiff is 
20 miles. There is a myriad of much more locally based photographers. 

7. Why do you not hold information on what is or is not essential work within Wales 
during Covid-19? 

8. Is essential work during Covid UK (Westminster / Parliament) legislation or 
additional legislation by the Welsh Government? 

 


