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Dear
ATISN 14128 - Audit on monuments, street names, buildings relating to slavery
trade
Thank you for your request, which I received on 8 July 2020 about the audit of public
monuments in Wales asking for:
1. A full list of all street names, statues, building names, monuments etc that
are included in the full audit across Wales. And can these be arranged by
area.
2. If these can’t be arranged by area, can you provide me each area
individually?
I can confirm that we do not hold the information that you describe. The principal
objective of the audit is to compile such a list.
3. The estimated cost for the audit.
4. A full breakdown of the estimated cost for the audit.
The cost of carrying out the audit is covered by refocussing internal Welsh
Government staffing resources; together with some specialist input at a cost of up to
£7,000.
5. The estimated cost to change everything if this goes ahead.
6. A full breakdown of the estimated cost to change everything if this goes
ahead.
We do not hold information about the estimated cost of the changes you describe.
The purpose of the audit is to gather evidence to inform possible future actions.
7. What research was carried before making this decision?
Gwasanaeth amgylchedd hanesyddol Llywodraeth Cymru yw Cadw, sy’n gweithio i sicrhau
bod amgylchedd hanesyddol Cymru yn hygyrch ac yn cael ei ddiogelu’n dda.
Cadw is the Welsh Government's historic environment service working for an accessible
and well-protected historic environment for Wales.
Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn Gymraeg ac yn Saesneg.
We welcome correspondence in both English and Welsh.

I can confirm that we do not hold the information that you describe. One of the
purposes of the audit is to undertake research and collect information and evidence
in order to inform any future decisions.
The Task and Finish Group set up by the Welsh Government to audit place-names
and historic monuments in Wales that may be associated with slavery, will report to
the First Minister by the end of October 2020.
The Written Statement issued by the First Minister explaining the scope of the audit
is available on the Welsh Government website in the link attached:
https://gov.wales/written-statement-audit-public-monuments-street-and-buildingnames-associated-history-black
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you
can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s
Freedom of Information Officer at:
Information Rights Unit,
Welsh Government,
Cathays Park,
Cardiff
CF10 3NQ
or email: freedomofinformation@gov.wales
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The
Information Commissioner can be contacted at:
Information Commissioner’s Office,
Wycliffe House,
Water Lane,
Wilmslow,
Cheshire,
SK9 5AF
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a
complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.
Yours sincerely,

