
 
18 June 2020 
 
 
Dear  
 
ATISN14012 - Badger bTB tests 
 
Thank you for your request which I received on 21 May about Badger bTB tests in 
Wales. The information you requested, where available, is provided below. 
 

1. Confirmation that initial studies were carried out supporting the use of DPP as 
a DIVA test in badgers, if so, can you provide the report or the conclusions of 
the report? 

 
No studies were undertaken by Welsh Government. Studies were ongoing in 
the Republic of Ireland (ROI) and Northern Ireland (NI) and we sought advice 
as indicated in previous responses. 
 

2. Why was BCG Sofia the vaccine of choice? 
 
When it was established that Badger BCG produced by Statens Serum Institute 
in Denmark would not be available for some time, Welsh Government officials, 
with Defra, explored the options of sourcing an alternative supply using 
standard human vaccine to allow vaccination to take place. Defra received 
confirmation from InterVax they were able to provide the UK with the BCG Sofia 
vaccine, without compromising their ability to supply vaccine for human 
vaccination.  This was already the vaccine of choice used by The Republic of 
Ireland (ROI) in their badger vaccination projects. Likewise, the Department of 
Agriculture, Environment and Rural Affairs in Northern Ireland (NI) had also 
used BCG Sofia vaccine in their Trap, Vaccinate or Remove (TVR) project since 
2017. 

 
3. How can you be certain that the antibody response to BCG has declined 

sufficiently not to elicit a cross reaction on further testing with DPP. 
 

As responded previously, advice received was based on the findings from 
studies undertaken in the ROI and NI. The ROI study found that 
seroconversion declined over 12 months (in all badgers where whole blood 
was DPP tested, all tested negative).    
 

4. How do you ascertain and quantify the antibody presence where no 
interference with DPP will occur? 

 
We do not hold this information. The Animal and Plant Health Agency (APHA) 
will respond to this. 
 

5. Please can you provide the conclusion or extracts, without compromising 
technical confidentiality of the validation of the IGRA badger test, June 2018. 

 
We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 
 

 

https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.google.co.uk%2Furl%3Fsa%3Dt%26rct%3Dj%26q%3D%26esrc%3Ds%26source%3Dweb%26cd%3D3%26cad%3Drja%26uact%3D8%26ved%3D0ahUKEwjX89q3zsvQAhWJL8AKHQ4QD_kQFggiMAI%26url%3Dhttps%253A%252F%252Fwww.daera-ni.gov.uk%252Fabout-daera%26usg%3DAFQjCNG428uK8oIV2_x0DTaRGcH5EdEN7w%26bvm%3Dbv.139782543%2Cd.ZGg&data=02%7C01%7CLydia.Chambers%40gov.wales%7C8d8caf4e04c74276e9b508d807be754d%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637267861871811768&sdata=Ki61SD7GzxoHipsdRN9XofYPjnsjYIBNZm65UGVxWks%3D&reserved=0
https://eur01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.google.co.uk%2Furl%3Fsa%3Dt%26rct%3Dj%26q%3D%26esrc%3Ds%26source%3Dweb%26cd%3D3%26cad%3Drja%26uact%3D8%26ved%3D0ahUKEwjX89q3zsvQAhWJL8AKHQ4QD_kQFggiMAI%26url%3Dhttps%253A%252F%252Fwww.daera-ni.gov.uk%252Fabout-daera%26usg%3DAFQjCNG428uK8oIV2_x0DTaRGcH5EdEN7w%26bvm%3Dbv.139782543%2Cd.ZGg&data=02%7C01%7CLydia.Chambers%40gov.wales%7C8d8caf4e04c74276e9b508d807be754d%7Ca2cc36c592804ae78887d06dab89216b%7C0%7C0%7C637267861871811768&sdata=Ki61SD7GzxoHipsdRN9XofYPjnsjYIBNZm65UGVxWks%3D&reserved=0


6. Is the Farm Level Interventions Study to which you refer separate from annual 
badger intervention trap and test operations? 
If yes, please provide details and description of the study, including the 
objectives, timescale and funding, together with relevant links for further 
information. 
 
We do not hold this information. APHA will respond to this. 

 
If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, you can 
ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response.  
Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government’s 
Freedom of Information Officer at:  
 
Information Rights Unit,  
Welsh Government, 
Cathays Park,  
Cardiff,  
CF10 3NQ  
 
or Email: Freedomofinformation@gov.wales 
 
Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     
 
You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The Information 
Commissioner can be contacted at:  Information Commissioner’s Office,  
Wycliffe House,  
Water Lane,  
Wilmslow,  
Cheshire,  
SK9 5AF 
 
However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint 
until it has been through our own internal review process. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 

mailto:Freedomofinformation@gov.wales

