

Ein cyf / Our ref: ATISN 13507

Dyddiad / Date: 12/11/2019

AMENDED RESPONSE (issued 06/12/2019)

Dear ,

ATISN 13507 – Request for information in relation to Osbourne Lodge Day Nursery.

Thank you for your request which I received on 15/10/2019. You asked for:

1. Building control officer documents paperwork
2. The structural engineer report before it opened
3. The air quality report
4. The public liability insurance and company
5. The A&E book relating to an incident involving a named individual

I will respond to each point in turn but firstly I wish to set out the history of Care Inspectorate Wales (CIW) and our predecessor organisation Care and Social Services Inspectorate Wales (CSSIW). CSSIW was established in 2002 as the independent regulator of social care and childcare in Wales. In January 2018 (not November 2017 as stated in our original response) CSSIW changed its name to CIW.

Point 1 - Please find attached a copy of the Certificate of Completion from Torfaen County Borough Council dated 23 November 2017.

Point 2 - CIW does not hold this information. The nursery was registered prior to CSSIW being established therefore it would have been registered under the previous regulator.

Point 3 - CIW does not hold this information. CIW does not regulate or test air quality as part of our role.

Point 4 - CIW does not hold this information. The nursery was registered prior to CSSIW being established therefore it would have been registered under the previous regulator.

Point 5 – CIW does not hold this information. Services are not required to submit accident logs to CIW.

You also subsequently requested copies of all CIW inspection reports for Osbourne Lodge Day Nursery. These were sent to you on 01/11/2019.

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government's handling of your request, you can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this response. Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh Government's Freedom of Information Officer at:

Information Rights Unit
Welsh Government
Cathays Park
Cardiff
CF10 3NQ
or Email: Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a complaint until it has been through our own internal review process.

Yours sincerely

Kirsty Manton
Quality & Information Manager