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14 September 2016     

Dear ,  

 

ATISN 10672 - request for information about publicity activity and costs 

for landlord registration and licensing. 

 

Thank you for your request, which I received on 18 August, regarding 

publicity activity and costs for landlord registration and licensing. You asked: 

 

1. what publicity has been commissioned by the Welsh Government, or 

its agencies, in relation to landlord registration and licensing.  

2. for details to be provided of any social media, newspaper, TV or radio 

campaigns and leaflet drops by Royal Mail. 

3. how much has been spent on this publicity. 

 

The Welsh Government has undertaken a comprehensive publicity campaign 

to inform landlords, agents and tenants of the changes to the law and what 

they need to do in order to comply. The campaign has been running since 

July 2015.  

Details of the specific activities that have formed the campaign are as follows: 

Publicity activities commissioned so far 

 

56 newspaper adverts - Publications include Daily Post, South Wales Argus, 

South Wales Evening Post, South Wales Echo, Cynon Valley Leader, 

Glamorgan Gazette, Gwent Gazette, Pontypridd & Llantrisant Observer, 

Merthyr Express, Rhondda Leader, Rhymney Valley Express. 

 

24 digital publicity initiatives - Online sites include Google Display Network, 

Google, Facebook, Zoopla, Rightmove, Wales Online, Daily Post Online. 

 

76 bus adverts - covering bus routes across Wales. 

 



 

295,000 leaflets and 32,000 posters have been designed and printed. These 

have mainly been distributed to local authorities and Rent Smart Wales for 

distribution locally and for local events and activities to raise awareness. 

They have also been distributed through a mailshot to known landlords and 

letting agents who have provided their contact details to Rent Officers Wales.   

 

Further publicity to be commissioned 

 

The commissioning of further publicity activity is currently in the pipeline. This 

will include further newspaper and digital online advertising through some of 

the channels listed above, as well as radio advertising on Heart Radio in 

North and South Wales. Additional bus and train advertising will also be 

commissioned.  

 

Amount spent on publicity campaign 

 

The total amount that has been spent or committed to be spent by the Welsh 

Government on the publicity campaign commissioned from the start of the 

project to the current date is £141,682. 

 

At this point in time, the anticipated cost of the further publicity to be 

commissioned, as detailed above, is £32,952. 

 

Local authority publicity activities  

 

In addition to publicity commissioned directly by the Welsh Government, local 

authorities in Wales were provided with funding in 2015/2016 to prepare for 

the implementation of Rent Smart Wales. Some local authorities used part of 

the funding they were awarded on promoting awareness of and publicising 

the new requirements in their local area.  

 

We do not hold full details of all the activities they have undertaken but 

activities have included local newspaper, radio and bus advertising, leaflets 

and letter mailshots. According to the records we hold, the total funding spent 

on promotion and publicity activities by local authorities was £72,763.  

 

We do not hold all the specific details on these activities, therefore, if you 

require further specific information on these activities you would need to 

contact individual local authorities directly. 

 

If you are dissatisfied with the Welsh Government’s handling of your request, 

you can ask for an internal review within 40 working days of the date of this 

response.  Requests for an internal review should be addressed to the Welsh 

Government’s Freedom of Information Officer at:  

 

Information Rights Unit,  

Welsh Government,  

Cathays Park,  

Cardiff,  

CF10 3NQ  



 

or Email: ,FreedomOfInformationOfficer@wales.gsi.gov.uk 

 

Please remember to quote the ATISN reference number above.     

 

You also have the right to complain to the Information Commissioner.  The 

Information Commissioner can be contacted at:   

 

Information Commissioner’s Office,  

Wycliffe House,  

Water Lane,  

Wilmslow,  

Cheshire,  

SK9 5AF. 

 

However, please note that the Commissioner will not normally investigate a 

complaint until it has been through our own internal review process. 

 

Yours sincerely 
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